City of Norton

4060 Columbia Woods Dr.

_ Norton, Ohio 44203
NORTON Administration (330) 825-7815 - Finance (330) 825-4511
Mayor Joe Kernan Fax: (330) 825-3104

NOTICE

A CITY OF NORTON BOARD OF CONTROL MEETING

HAS BEEN SCHEDULED FOR MONDAY., MARCH 12, 2007,

AT PM, IN COUNCIL CHAMBERS.

E-Mailed: 3/9/2007 Akron Beacon Journal
Barberton Herald
West Side Leader

POSTED: March 9, 2007

03/09/07 10:42 AM



City of Norton
BOARD OF CONTROL
AG E N D A Mayor Joseph M. Kernan

FOR: Monday, March 12, 2007

TIME:

CONSIDERATION OF PREVIOUS BOARD OF CONTROL MINUTES
February 26, 2007 BOARD OF CONTROL MEETING

1

NEW BUSINESS:

1. Consideration of Ted Weinsheimer's recommendations for the 2007 Service Department
Materials. (Funding: Service Department, Supplies and Materials 102-4100-55563 and Permissive
Tax, Supplies and Materials 104-4300-54430)

attachments

cC: Mayor Kernan
Administrative Officer
Director of Finance
President of Council
Vice President of Council
Council Members and Clerk



City of Norton

4060 Columbia Woods Drive
Norton, Ohio 44203

NORTON | | Adminimration ;}3{3((;)3 gfg;ss 15 6230-825-4511

Maybif'-._i_éfnle's A. Prigé »

BOARD OF CONTROL MEETING MINUTES
' March 12, 2007 - '

. TIME: 6:30p in the Safety/Administration»Building, Council Chambers

PRESENT: Joseph Kernan, Mayor
- John Moss, Director of Finance
James Price, President of Council (arrived at 6:37)
’ Dennis McGlone, Vice-President of Council
ALSO , ,
PRESENT: Ted Weinsheimer, Superintendent of Public Service

; The Board of Control convened for a meeting at 6:35p on March 12, 2007 in the
Safety/Administration Building, Council Chambers. Mayor Kernan called the meeting to order.

CONSIDERATION OF MINUTES:

Mayor Kernan presented the Board of Control meeting m>inutes of Monday, February
26, 2007, as written. Mr. Moss motioned to accept the minutes as presented, Mr. McGlone
seconded.

ROLL CALL YEAVOTES: Mr. Moss, Mr. McGlone, Mayor Kernan
NAY VOTES: None

Motion paésed with a vote of 3-0.

NEW BUSINESS:

Agenda ltem #1: Consideration of Ted Weinsheimer’s recommendations for the 2007 Service
Department Materials. (Funding: Service Department, Supplies and Materials 102-4100-55563 and
Permissive Tax, Supplies and Materials 104-4300-54430)

Mr. Weinsheimer reviewed his recommendations resulting from the Service Department
Materials bid opening of February 13, 2007. '

Mr. McGlone motioned to accept Mr. Weinsheimer's recommendations for Service
Department mate‘rials as stated in his memo, which Mr. Moss seconded.

ROLL CALL YEAVOTES: - Mr. McGlone, Mr. Moss, Mr. Price, Mayor Kernan
NAY VOTES: None '
Motion passed with a vote of 4-0.



Board of Control Minutes of 3-12-07
Page # 2 of 2

OLD BUSINESS: None

There being no further business, the meeting was adjourned at 6:42p

4 [t

hn Moss, Finance Director

ames A. .Price, M,ayor

Date approved: /7,/ ﬂ s U 7

lfamc

cc: Board Members
Council Members
Clerk of Council

file



The City of Norton - Inter - Office Memo

TO: Mayor Kernan
FROM: Ted Weinsheimer, Supt. of Public Service
DATE: 3/2107

SUBJECT: Road Materials recommendations for 2007

After review of the bid packages for Road Materials my recommendations are as follows.

Limestone, Aggregate base 304 J & J Elite Transport Inc.

e Lowest Bid for delivered price & Norton Business
s 6% increase over last year

Bituminous Cold mix 405 D & R Supply
e Only Bidder
e 20% increase over last year

Winter Asphalt patch material Shelly Materials
¢ No Bids received
e Current price $71.00/Ton 11% increase over last year

Culvert Pipe & Bands Pipelines, Inc.
e Overall Lowest Bid

o 5% decrease over last year

Corrugated Polyethylene Pipe
o Lowest Bid for 12” — 36” pipe Pipelines, Inc.
o 7.5% decrease over last year

Hi-Q Polyethylene Pipe and Split Couplings, Tees & Grates Pipelines, Inc.

e No Minimum delivery

o For every 50-foot of pipe purchased, 1 Tee and Split Coupler and grate is purchased.
Price per 50 foot is lower with Pipelines Inc than HD Supply Waterworks, Discount
Drainage or Marlboro.
Hi-Q Polyethylene Pipe had an 7.5% decrease over last year
Split Couplings & Tees had an 6% increase over last year
Polyethylene grates had an 23% increase over last year

Transition Lids Discount Drainage
e Overall lowest bid
o 55% decrease over last year

Gratings Pipelines, Inc
o Lowest Bid
o  79% decrease over last year



2007 Service Department Material Bid - Bid Results

Pipes, Couplings and Grates

Company

Stephanie Trayer
Discount Drainage

2600 S. Arlington Rd.

Akron OH 44319
(ck# 814375664)

Delivery Notes:

No Min Delivery

$750.00 min order for

delivery

Prices same either picked up or
delivered except where indicated

Product:

Culvert Pipe and Bands

12" $5.34 P/U: $5.65 DEL: $5.97
Bands 5.51 P/U: $5.65 DEL: $5.97
15" $6.73 P/U: $7.10 DEL: $7.55
Bands $6.95 P/U. $7.10 DEL: $7.55
18" $8.15 P/U: $8.60 DEL: $9.15
Bands $8.40 P/U: $8.60 DEL: $9.15
24" 10.97 P/U: $11.59 DEL: $12.29
Bands 11.30 P/U: $11.59 DEL: $12.29
36" 17.95 P/U: $18.95 DEL: $20.09
Bands 318.50 P/U: $18.95 DEL: $20.09

Corrugated Polyethylene Pipe

12" $2.81 $3.03
15" $4.50 $4.83
18" $7.81 $8.39
24" $12.31 $13.22
36" $23.27 nlal
Hi-Q Polyethylene Pipe

12" $3.72 $3.99
15" $4.96 35.32
18" $7.74 $8.30
24" $11.92 $12.79
Split Couplings and Tees

12" $3.88 $3.99
Tees $61.07 $62.79
15" $5.17 $5.32
Tees $91.27 $93.85
18" $8.08 $8.30)
Tees $128.04 $131.65|
24" $12.43 $12.79
Tees $197.95 $203.55
Polyethylene Grates :

12" $22.75 ]
15" $58.70 $22.50
18" $64.00 $68.69
24" $110.00 $120.00

Transition Lids

ODOT 2-3, 48"x48", 5"thick

ODOT 3A, 39"x38", 8" thick

32'x32" ID, 44"x44"

Gratings

East Jordan Iron Works
#5110M3

$82.20

$88.00

Frame-East Jordan Iron Works
#5110Z

$47.93

$51.50

East Jordan Iron Works
#7266

$396.18

$425.00
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2007 Service Department Material Bid - Bid Results Pipes, Couplings and Grates

Scott Schwinn
Marlboro Supply
Company 9271 Edison St.
Louisville OH 44641
(chkd#t 302531)
. ) , Per Load
Delivery Notes: No Min Delivery Minimum delivery: $500.00
Allprices either picked up or
Delivered All prices either picked up or Delivereq
Product:
Culvert Pipe and Bands
12" n/a
Bands nla
15" n/a
Bands n/a
18" n/a
Bands n/a
24" n/a
Bands n/a
36" n/a
Bands n/a
Corrugated Polyethylene Pipe
12" $2.75
15" 4.41
18" 57.65
24" $12.06
36" $22.55
Hi-Q Polyethylene Pipe :
12" $3.75
15" 34.94
18" $7.69
24" $11.85
Spilit Couplings and Tees
12" $3.75
Tees $59.00
15" $4.94
Tees $88.15
18" $7.69
Tees $124.00
24" $11.85
Tees $191.00
Polyethylene Grates :
12" : R i $22.00 $20.95
15" $54.27] \ $54.00
AT $75.60 \
18" \[t: 7 EJIW 621 61.31: $72.00
T $132.9 )
24" IV 6224=$107:10 $126.00
Lo

Transition Lids A
ODOT 2-3, 48"x48", 5"thick n/a n/a
ODOT 3A, 39"x38", 6" thick n/a nfa
32"x32" ID, 44"x44" n/a nia
Gratings
East Jordan lron Works
#5110M3 n/a
Frame-East Jordan [ron Works
#51102 n/a
East Jordan Iron Works R N |
#7266 el T L:, N '," s e e Y z $378,55 n/a

2t
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2007 City of Norton Service Department Materials Bids - bid resuits Road Paftch Materials

J & JElite D&R Supply
Transportation Gary Radabaugh
Jim Wright 18228 Fulton Rd.
Company 3790 S. Cleve-Mass Rd Marshallville OH
Norton OH 44203 44645
Check # 5930812953 Ck # 102558744

Limestone,
Aggregate Base, 1: NO B
Number 304 Deliveryy;’:$13;9‘5,

no bid

Bituminous Cold Mix, Number

405 no bid

Winter Asphalt Patch Material no bid no bid
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